O

e

Cre

JAMAI CA GAZETTE

'SUPPLEMENT

" PROCLAMATIONS, 'RULES AND REGULATIONS

571
Vol. XCVIR THURSDAY, OCTOBER 30, 1975 ' No. 105
No. 339
THE MINIMUM WAGE ACI‘
L . THE - NATIONAL MINIMUM WAGE ORDBR 1975

In excrczsa “of the power Lonferred upon the Minister by sectxon 3 of the Mlmmum o

Wage Act the following Order is hereby made:.

1, ThlS Oider may be cited as the National Minimum Wage Order, ]975 Qi:ggg K

and shall come into force on the 2nd day of November, 1975 mencement.
2. In this Order, unless the context otherwxse requlres——- ' fI,m‘ﬂ‘Pl'e{“"

tion
“household worker” meéang a worker employed to work .in" a privaté
place of residence; :

“normial working day” means,. in relatmn to any worker, any day on
which that worker js normally required to work for his employer
but does not include~—

(@) arest day; or
{b) -a public holiday;

“pu blic holiday” means—




0
®

572 PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS “[OcT. 30, 1975
(a) any ,d‘ay-;‘whic;h under the provisions of any enactment for the
time ‘being in force is. or is declared to be, or is proclaimed
as, a public general holiday; and
(b) Good Friday and Christmas Day; _ ,
- “rest day” means in reiation to any worker, the day allowed to that
worker in accordance with paragraph 3.as a rest day;
. “wage” means remuneration in money and does not include the value
. of— o . ' . e -
(a) any lodgings or food supplied; or
(b) - any other benefit ‘conferred, o
to or on any worker by his employer;

“weck™ means the period commencing immediately after twelve o'clock
~ midnight on each Saturday and ending at twelve o’clock midnight
~on the Saturday next following; ‘

«worket” means an individual who' has entered into, or works under,
~ a contract with an employer, whether the contract is express oOr

implied, and (if it is express) whether it is oral or in writing, and

includes any indivdual employed: aboard any aircraft registered in
Jamaica or aboard any ship registered in Jamaica, but does not

include—- . ’ _ A .

(a) any individual employed under a contract of apprentice-

_ _ship which is registered under the Appreiiticeship Act: or

{b) any_student ‘registered or enrolled at any educational
_institution recognized by the Minister responsible for edu-
cation and employed during any vacation granted by that
educational institution; or ~ o

(¢) any individual employed in such basic school or day care
centre or sheltered workshop as may be recognized by the
Minister for the purpose of this definition; or -

© (d) any individual performing work which is a part of his
fraining.in any institution ceriified by the Minister to be.
a vocational training institution; or - :

(e) any individual—- _ _

(i) certified by the Minister to be a learner; and -

{ii) performing, in a place of employment specified
in the Minister's certificate, work which is a
part of that individual’s training during a period
of trajning specified in that certificate; or -

() any individual employed by a franchise ‘holder as defined
in the Public Passenger Transport (Rural Area) Act, to
drive, or accompany the driver of, any stage carriage Or
express carriage provided by that franchise holder.

Rest day. 3. (1) Every erﬁployer shall, in each week during which any worker,

other than an hourly worker as defined in paragraph 5, works for him, aliow
that worker one day as a rest day. :

(2) The day on which the rest day of any worker is to fall in any
particular week shall be determinedl by agreement between that worker and
his employeér. : .




+Ocr.. 30, 1975] PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS - 573

Subject to the provisions of paragraph 8, the national minimum wage Nahonal
for workers other than household .workers _ is hereby fixed at the rate of— w;';’;nm
(a) 50 cents per hour for work done by those workers during any
period not exceeding— .
(i) 8 hours on a normal workjng day, or
(i)’ 40 hours in any week;
(b) 75 cents per hour for work .done by those workers during any
© period in excess of 8 hours on a normal workmg day or in excess
of 40 hours in any week; :
(¢) one dellar per hour for work done by those workers durmg any
- period on a rest day ora pubhc holiday.

5 (1) Subject to the provisions of paragraph - 8 the fainimum Wage for Minimum

(,4’"‘" household workers who are employed ak weekly workers is hereby- fixed wage for
. household

at the rate of—
workers.

(a) $20. per .week for work done by household workers whose normal -
working week is 40 hours, and 75 cents per hour for work done .-
during any period in eXeess of 40 houis in any week;

(b). $20.50 per- ‘week for:-work done-by household workers whose

Q - , ’ * . normal working week is 41 hours, and-75 cents per hour for work
S ' .~ done during any period in excess of 41 hours in any week;
‘ A (c) $21 per week for work ‘done by household workers whose normal

working week is 42 hours, and 75 cents per hour for work done
.. during any period in excess of 42 hours in any week;
(d) $21.50 per week for- work donme by household workers - whose
- normal working week is 43 hours, and 75 cents per_Hour - for
work done during any perlod in excess of 43 hours in ‘any week;

' (¢) $22 per week for work done by household workers whose normal
working week is 44 hours, and 75 Eents: per hour for work done
~ -during any period in excess of 44 hours in atiy week:;. .
“{f) one dollar per hour for WOrk done by’ household workers durmg :
" any perrod on a rest day Or 4 public hohday. R ‘

(2) Subject to-the provxsrons ‘of paragraph 8 the mrmmum wagc for

at the rate of—

(a) 50 cents. per hour for Work done. by those workers duung .any
period not éxceeding 8 hours on any day other than a. pubhc'
holiday; -

(b) 75 cents per hour for work done by those workers durmg any

. period in excess of 8 hiours on any day;- . .

(c) one dollar per hour for ‘work ‘done. by those workers durmg ‘any
period or a public hohday. : . T

oC

3) In this paragraph— . o s
“hourly workers” means workers who usuaIIy work for less than 40
hours per week for one employer,

“formal working ‘week™ means " the number of hours in each week
during which the weekly worker in relauon to whom that ex-

"""" houschold workers who are employed as hourly woikers 1s hereby ﬁxed- S




S 574 PROCLAMATIONS, RULES' AND REGULATIONS [Oct. 30, 1975

pression is used is ‘normally required to work for his employer
but does not include any period on a rest day or a public holiday;

“weekly workers” means workers who by agreement with their em-
~ ployers regularly work for not less than 40 hours per week for

one employer.

Workers 6. (1) Any period during which any worker, acting on the instructions
shall fbe of his employer. waits at his work place in order o bé available to perform
paic 1ot any of his duties whenever he ‘is required to do so shall be reckoned, for

’rtiftmg U the purposes of paragraph 4 or 5 as the case may.require, as a period during
which work is done by that worker.

(2) Where a casiial worker reports for duty at his work place on any
day in accordance with the instructions of his -employer and the provisions
of sub-paragraph (1) do not apply as a result of any special circumstances
of the case, that worker shall be deemed, for the purposes of paragraph 4

. . . .....c or.5,as the case may require— . o
v " (a) to have worked 4 hours on that day if he is not required to do any
‘ work or if the number of hours for which hé is-reqitired to work .
is not more than 4; or

O ; _ ’ ~ (b) to have worked for 8 hours if the numbe'r'of hours for which he
. : , s required to work is more than 4 but less than 8.
. ' . (3) For the purposes of sub-paragraph (2) “casual worker” means any ‘

worker who is employed—
(2) from day to day; or : o
(b) for the performance of a particular task which normally. cannot
be performed in less than one working day. : .

Offences. 7. Any employer who— ~ ~ - L - .
v (a) contravenes the provisions of sub-paragraph (1) of paragraph (8); or
(b) deducts from the wages of any worker 'any amount for lodgings
" or food supplied by him to that worker or for any other benefit
o conferred by him on that worker, - : ‘ )
shall be guilty of an offence and be liable on summary conviction before a -
Resident Magistrate to a fine mot exceeding oné “hundred- dollars and in
~ default of payment to imprisonment for a term not exceeding three months.

: . . -
Savings. 8. (1) Where any order (othéer than this Order) made under the Act B
e - fixes in respect of any worker a minimum wage of which the hourly rate
_is higher than the hourly rate of the minimum wage fixed in respect of that
worker by this Order, the hourly rate of ‘the minimum wage fixed by that
order shall apply in respect of ‘that worker instead of the hourly rate of the
minimum wage fixed by this Order.

~ (2) Nothing in this Ordet shall be construed as preventing the pay-
ment. of wages at rates higher' than the rates fixed by this Order and all
contracts of employment subsisting at the coming into force of this Order
at such higher rales shall continue to be valid. ‘ :

)
o

Dated this 22nd day of October, 1975. o
' ERNEST G. PEART, .

Minister of Labour and Employment.

PRINTED BY THE GOVERNMENT PRINTER, DUKE STREET, KINGSTON, JAMAICA

7




. /\v
(
®

- SUPPLEMENT

PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS
) . ’ 134

Vol CIII : WEDNESDAY, JUNE 11, 1980 -. No. 37B

No. 828 e
- THE MINIMUM WAGE ACT

THE NATIONAL MINIMUM WAGE (AMENDMENT) ORDLR, i980

In exercise of the power conferred upon the Minister by section 3 of the Minimum
Wage Act, and of every other power hereunto enabling, the following Order is hereby
made :— ’ ‘

1. This Order may be cited as the National Minimum Wage {Amendmer::}
Order, 1980 and shail be read and construed as one with the National Minimum
Wage Order, 1975 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Order) - and '
amendments thereto and shall come into force on the 16th day of June, 198. .

2. The principal Order is hereby amended in paragraph 2 by—

(a) deleting the fullstop “appearing at the end of .sub-paragraph ) oi tr:
definition of “worker” and substituting therefor a semicolon und ti
word “or”; and ‘ :

(b) inserting mext after sub-paragraph (f) of the definition
“worker” the following sub-paragraph— ' '

“(g) any individual employed by the Government or by e King-.
and Saint Andrew Corporation or any Parish €'owndil o -
the Special Labour Intensive Employment Proie:

Relief of Unemployment.”.




1340 . PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS [June 11, 1980 |

3. The principal Order is hereby amended by deleting paragraphs_4 and 5 and
substituting therefor the following— . .

“National . 4. Subject to the provisions of paragraph 8, the natjonal minimﬁm
- Minimum wage for workers other than household workers is hereby fixed at
Wagf" the rate of— ‘

(a) 75 cents per hour for work done by those workers during
any period not exceeding— ‘ ‘
‘(i) 8 hoursona normal working day; or
(i) 40 hours in any week; C
(b) $1.13 per hour for work done by those workers during

.

any period in excess of 8 hours on a normal working day
or in excess of 40 hours in any week; _

©) $1.50 per hour for work done by those workers during any
. period on a rest day or a public holiday. :

' - o Minimum 5. (1) Subject to the provisions of paragfaiph 8, the minimum wage_‘
Q ' ‘ggg‘;:&l d for household workers who are employed as weekly workers is

hereby fixed at the rate of—

. : workers. :
. ' _ S . (a) $30 per week for work done by household workers whose
' : - ' normal working week is 40 hours, and $1.13 per hour for
_work done during any period in excess of 40 hours in
any week; v '

(b) $30.75 per week for work done by household workers whose

normal working week is 41 hours, and $1.13 per hour for . -

o ' work done during any period in excess of 41 hours -in
' any week; : .

: (c) . $31.50 per week for work done by household workers whose

o . _ . normal working week is 42 hours, and $1.13 per hour for

e - work done during any period in excess of 42 ‘hours in

any week; o ‘ o

(d) $32.25 per week for work done by household workers

whose normal working week is 43 hours, and $1.13 per

hour for work done during any period in excess of 43
hours in any week; : -

(e) $33 per week for work dome by household workers whose
normal working week is 44 hours, and $1.13 per hour for -

_ : . work done during any period in excess of 44 hours in
Q , IR _ any week;
' _ , : v () $1.50 per hour for work done .by household workers
. during any period on a rest day or a public holiday.

| (2) Subject to the provisions of paragraph 8, the minimum
wage for household workers who are employed as hourly workers is
hereby. fixed at the rate of— ' - '

(a) 75 cents per hour for work done by those workers during.
any period not exceeding 8 hours on any day other than
a public holiday; o .

(b) $1.13 per hour for work done by those workers during

- any period in excess of 8 hours on any day;




(_"

JunE 11, 1980]

. PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS‘ , 1348

(¢) $1.50 per hour for work done by those workers dﬁring any

period on a public holiday.
" (3) In this paragraph—

“hourly workers” means workers who usually work for less -

than 40 hours per week for one employer;

“normal working week” means the number of hours in each
week during which the weekly ‘worker in relation to whom
that expression is used is normally required to work for
his employer but does not include any period on a rest
day or a public holiday;

“weekly workers” means workers who by agreement with their
employers regularly work for not less than 40 hours per week
for.one employer.”. '

Dated this 3rd day of June, 1980.

~ No. C193/52

Howarp F. COOKE,
Minister of Labour and the Public Service.

PRINTID BY THE SOVERNMENT PRINTER, DUKE STREET. KINGSTOM. JAMAICA.




Y
J

&

THE T

- JAMAICA E%ZETTE

SUPPLEMENT

PROCLf\MATIO‘\lS, RULES AND REGULATIONS _
’ : : 83

Vol. CXI THURSDAY, MAY 26, 1988  No. 22

No. 44

The following Order was approved by an affirmative Resolution of the House of

Representanves on the 25th May, 1988.
THE MINIMU\I WAGE ACI‘

THE NATIONAL Mmmuw WAGE (AMENDMENT) ORDER, 1988

In exercise of the power conferred upon the Minister by section 3 f the \lm mum

Wage Act. and of every other power hereunto enablmg the following Order is hereby -

made : —

1. This Order mm be cited as the National \/hmmum Wagze (Amendment) :

Order, 1988, and shall be read and construed as one with the Nt ‘tional Minimum
Wage Order. 1973 (hereinafter referred to as the prmupal Order) and all amend-
. ments therelo.

2. The principal Order is sinended by deleting paragragh 4.and 5 and substitu-
ting therefor the following— :

“Nutional 1.—(1) Subject to the provisions of paragraph 8. \\irh effect
i : T B

minjmum . from the 6th day of June: 1988, the national minimunr wage. for
wage. ... wdrkers other than household workers is herebv hxed at ths rate
' of—

(2) S2.00 per hour for work done by thos: workers during
any period not exceading—
{i) 8 hours on a normal working day: or
i) 40 hours in anv waek:




84 PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS [MAy 26, 1988

~ (b) $3.00 per hour for work done by those workers during
_any period in excess of 8 hours vn a, normal working.
day or in.excessiof 40 hours in any week; :

(c) S4.00 per héur for work done by those workers during
any periud on a rest day or a public holiday.

' - . (2) Subject to the provisions of - paragraph 8, with effect
' from the 2nd day of January, 1989, the national minimum wage

(] . ’ ' : for workers other than household workers is hereby fixed at the
: _— : : rate of— :
‘ . < : : R (a) $2.50 per hour for work done by those workers during

any period not exceeding—
(i) 8hoursona npormal working day; or
© (i) 40 hours in any week;
 (b) $3.75 per hour for woirk done by those workers -during
any period in excess of 8 hours on a normal working day
. or in excess of 40 hours in any w_eek; o
. : c . () $5.00 per hour for work done by those workers durin'g
: ' Lo "any period on a rest day or ‘on a pubiic hoiiday.

I-s'linimum 5..—(1) Subject. to the provisions of paragraph 8. Iwiz}i effect

wage for  from the 6th day of June, 1983, the minimum wage for hdusehold
househeld workers who are employed as weekly workers is hereby fixed at
. workers._ the rate of— : S

(a) $72.00 per week for work done by household .workess
: whose normal working week is 40 hours; and $2.70
per hour for work done during any period in excess of

40 hours in any week: :

(b) S$73.80 per week for work done b\ household ‘workers

. <3 whose normal working week is 4] hours. and S2.79 per
"~ hour for work done during any period in excess of 41
. ' . hours in any week: .

(¢) $75.60 .per week for work done by household workers
whose normal working week is 42 hours, and $2.70 per
hour for work done during any period in excess of 42
hours in any week: ’

(d) S$77.40 per week for work done by household workers
whose normal working week is 43 hours, and S2.70 per
hour for work done during any period in excess of 43
hours in any week:

{e) $79.20 per week for work done bv household workers

, whose normal working waok is 44 hours. und S2.7) per
. hour for work done during any period in excess of 44
. -hours in any week: : '

() $3.60 per hour for work done by household  workers
during any period on 2 rest day or public holiday.




Mav 26, iv88) PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS b

PR N X X I oot - o e Sl

i - oo . (2) Subject. to. thie- provisions: .of paragraph 8, with cﬁect :
a from the 2nd day of January; 1989, the minimum wage for house-
hold workers who are employed as weekly workers is hereby fixed
. at the raté of—
(a) $84.00 per week: for work, done by household workers
whose- npormal -working:week is 40 hours, and $3.15 per .
hour for work done dunng ady period in excess of 40
. hours in.any. week;

fj C _ (b) $86.10 per week for- work done by household workers

T o whose normal working ‘week is*41 hours, and $3.15 per

. L : o -hour for- work done-dlirmg any penod in excess of 41
o - : hours ih any’ week o

(c) 588.20 pet: week_ for. work done by- household workers
whose normal working week-is 42 bours, and $3.15 per
hour for work done: durmgg Any pgucxd«m Lxcess.of 42
hours in any week

. : ,_'. (d). $90.30 per Week for work done by househoid workers .
- : o " .whose normal working week is 43 hours, and $3.15 per
' hour for work done in excess of 43 hours tn aby week;

v , . ' (¢) $92.40 per week for work done by household workers '

: ' . — whose normal working week is 44 hours, and 3$3.15 per
. " . hour for work done during any period in excess of 44
i , ' hours in any week;

(f) $4.20 per hour for work done by houschold workers:
during any period on a rest day or public holiday. -

(3) Subject to the provisions of paragraph 8, with ctfcct .
from the 6th day of June, 1988. the minimum wage for household -
workers who are emploved as hourly workers is hereby fixed at

/«) ; . _ the rate of—

'<\_ o : , (a) S1.80 per hour for work done by those ‘workers during

. ) _ any period not exceeding 8 hours on any day other than
a public holiday;

(B) $2.70 per hour for work done by those workers during -
any period in excess of 8 hours on any day:

(c) $3.60 per hour for work. done by those workcrs during
any period on a public holiday. _

(4) Subject to the provisions of paragraph 3, with etfect
from the 2nd day of January, 1989. the minimum wage for
householu workers who are employed as hourI\ workers is hereby

xad at th= rate of—
{a) $2.10 per hour for work done by those workers during
an\ period not exceading 8 hours on any day other than
a public holiday:

(b} S3.15 per hour for work done by those workers during
. dny period TN pXCEs O §Hours o any dayi T T

L




86 . PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND, REGULATIONS  [May 26, ,198¢8

: . e
(c)-.$4:-2Q.-p¢r.-hour. for ,wofk done by those workers during
3 =al.-any period.on a public. holiday.. .

" (5) In this paragraph— : . ;- —.
.- “hourly workers” means workers who usually work for less

.= .. w=:than.40 hours per. week for one employer;

" ~“normil working week” means the number of hours in each

- week during which thé weekly worker in relation to

., . whom that expression is used is normally required to

..~ work for his employer but does not include any period
_." 7 'on'a test day or a public holiday;

“weekly workers” means workers who by agreement with

' their employers tegularly work for: not less than 40

ildicw K I L :
S o -+ +hours per week for one employer.”.
S 4TI L oAl AT L. PN o L

* Frafedthis 4th day of May; 1988 <~ T 1

e . e ... J. A G Swmn.
o mavie e .. Minister of Labour.

- C193

it

‘e

.-
.
.
]
’
.
£ aed -
poval ,
Lo FRINTED 8Y THZ GOVERNMENT PRINTIY, BUXE STATEST. KINGSTON. JAMAICA.




%

" SUPPLEMENT

PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS

746

Vol. CXIII FRIDAY, JUNE 1, 1990 - No. 202

No. 273 ' . ‘
THE MINIMUM WAGE ACT -

THE NATIONAL MINIMUM WAGE (AMENDMENT) ORDER, 1990

" In exercise of the power conferred upon the Minister by section 3 of the Minimum
Wage Act, and of every other power hereunto enabling, the following Order is hereby -
made: — C .
1. This Order may be cited as the National Minimum Wage (Amendment)
Order, 1990, and shall be read and construed as one with the National Minimum
Wage Order, 1975 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Order) and all amend-
- ments thereto. _ ) : o

2. The principal Order is amended by deleting paragraphs 4 and 5 and Sub-
stituting therefor the following— . . t S

“National . 4. Subject to fhe pfovisions of paragraph 8, with effect from

minimum  the 4th day of June, 1990, the national minimum wage for

wage. workers other than household workers is hereby fixed at the
rate of— o

(a) $3.25 per hour for work done by those workers
during any period not exceeding—

(i) 8 hours on a normal working day; or
-__(ii) 40 hours in any week; '




747 PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS  [JUNE 1, 1990

(b) $4.§8“pér,fﬁbuf§ﬁfor work donc_t;y those workers during
any;period -in- excess of 8 hours on a normal working
. c‘ia_)( or in excess of 40 hours in any week;

(c) $650 per hourfor _..wbrk done by those workers during

any-period on a rest day or on a public holiday.
Mipimum - 5—(1) Sugject"tdthe Aproyisions of paragraph 8, with effect
wage for from the 4th day of June, 1990, the minimum wage for house-

2%‘;}5(?;:’1‘1 hold workers who are employed. as'weekly workers is hereby
) fixed at the rate of— : o

(a) $110.00 per week for work done by household workers °
‘whose normal working week is 40 hours, and $4.13
per hour for work done during any period.in excess
of 40 hours in any week;

(b) $112.75 per week for work done by household
workers whose normal working week is 41 hours, and
$4.13 per hour for work done during any period in
excess of 41 hours in any week.

Qo

' (c) $115.50 per week for work done by household
: ) ’ workers whose normal working week is 42 hours. and

$4.13 per hour for work done during any period in

excess of 42 hours in any weck; . :

(d) $118.25 " per week for work done by household -
workers whose normal working week is 43 hours, -and
$4.13 per hour for work done in excess of 43 hours
in any week;

|
|

(¢) $121.00 per week for work done by household
workers whose normal working week is 44 houts and
$4.13 per hour for work-done during any period in
excess of 44 hours in any week; ‘

e R () 8550 per hour for work done by household workers
‘ during any period on a rest day or public holiday.

(2) Subject to the provisions of paragraph 8, with effect-

' O : from the 4th day of June, 1990, the minimum wage for house-
~ " hold workers who are employed as hourly workers is hereby
‘ fixed at the rate of— . :

(2) $2.75 per hour for work dome by those-workers during
any period not exceeding 8 hours on any day other
than a public holiday; . ° :

~ (b) $413 per hour for work done by those workers during
any period in excéss of 8 hours on any day;

(¢) $5.50 per hour for work done by those workers during
any period on a public holiday.

e




=

June 1, 1990] PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS 748

~ (3) In this paragrapﬁ——

“hourly workers” means workers who usually work for
less than 40 hours per week for one employer;

“pormal working week” means the number of hours in
each week during which the weekly worker in relation
to whom that expression is used is normally required
to work for his employer but does not include any
period on a rest day or 2 public holiday;

“weekly workers” means workers who by agreement with
their employers regularly work for not less than 40
hours per week for one employer.”.

Dated this 21st day of May, 1990.

PORTIA SIMPSON,
Minister of Labour.

No. 0193/S2

o
°

PRINTED BY THE GOVERNMENT PRINTER. DUXE STREET, KINGSTON, JAHAICA.




SUPPLEMENT

'PROCLAMATIONS, " RULES AND REGULATIONS
: ' ! 2244

4—_____‘;_:______,__..______———/‘.—

vol. CXIV MONDAY, JULY 1, 1991 o No. 33A

THE MINIMUM WAGE ACT

THE NATIONAL MINIMUM WAGE (AMENDMENT‘) ORDER, 1991
In exercise of the power conferred upon the Minister by section 3 of the Minimum

_Wage Act, and of every other power hereunto enabling, the following Order is hereby

made:

1. This" Order may be cited as fhe_ National Minimum Wage (Amenglineht) Order,
1991, and shall be read and construed as one with the National Minimum Wage
Order, 1975 (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Order) and all amendments
thereto. : ' ‘

9. The Principal Order ;s amended by deleting paragraphs 4 and 5 and substi-
tuting therefor the following— - :

«National 4. Subject to the provisions of paragraph 8, with effect from

minimum  the first day of July, 1991, the pational minimum ‘wage for-

wage. workers other than household workers is hereby fixed at the

rate of—

"i

3
}
:
;




2248 PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS  [uex 1991

(a) $4.00 per hour for work done by those workers during
any period not exceeding—

(i) 8hoursona normal working day; ot
(i) 40 hours in any week;.

(b) $6.00 per hour for work done by those workers during
, any period in excess of 8 hours on a pormal working -

day or in excess of 40 hours in any week;

(©) $8.00 per hour for work done by those workers during
any period on a rest day or on a public holiday. -

Minimum  5.—(1) Subject to the provisions. of paragraph' 8, with effect
Yage lffﬁ , fom the first day of July, 1991, the minimum Wago for house-
v::)‘;ferg hold workers who are employed as weekly workers is hereby
' ’ fixed at the rate of— :

gy I : (@ $140.00 per week for work done by household workers
Oy - whose normal working week is 40 houts, and" $5.25
- ' per hour for work done during any period in excess

. of 40 hours in any week; :

i - - (b) $143.50 per week for work done by household workers
, . whose normal working week is 41 hours, and $5.25
per hour for work done during any period in excess of

4] hours in any week. : .

| : ' ' (¢) $147.00 per week for work done by bousehold workers

i whose normal working week is 42 hours and $5.25-

! per bour for work done during any period in excess
of 42 hours in any week; :

(@ $150.50 per week for work done by houschold workers
7" whose normal working week is 43 hours, and $5.25 per
bour for work done in excess of 43 hours in any

week;

(¢) $154.00 per week for work done by housebold workers
whose normal working week is 44 hours and $5.25

per hour for work done during any period in excess
of 44 hours in any week; '

. @ $7.00 per hour for work done by household workers
() : ‘ .during any period on a rest day or public holiday.

. , : (2) Subject to the’ provisions of paragraph 8, with effect
. from the first day of July, 1991, the minimum wage for house-
hold workers who are employed as hourly workers is hereby

fixed at the rate of—

(a) $3.50 per bour for work done by those workers during
any period not exceeding 8 hours on any day other
than a public holiday;

(b) $5.25 per hour for work done by those workers during
any period in excess of 8 hours on any day;




e

" Protection of Depositors Act, and of every other power hereunto ena

Juy 1,1991] PROCLAMATIONS, RULES‘AND'REGULATIONS 224c¢

(c) .$7.00 per hour for work done by those workers during
any period on 2 public holiday.
(3) In this paragraph—

“hourly workers” means workers who usually work for
“less than 40 hours per week for ome employer; -

“normal working week” means the number of hours in

" each week during which the weekly worker in relation

to whom that expression is used is normally required

to work for his employer but does not include any pe-
riodonarestdayora public holidays

“weekly workers” means workers who by agreement with

their employers regularly work for not less than 40
hours per week for one employer.

" Dated this-25th day of June, 1991.

'POR’I'IA SIMPSON,
* Minister of Labour.

No. 193/S211

No. 558 ) ’ ' :
: THE‘PROTECI'ION OF DEPOSITORS ACT

TrE PROTECTION OF DeposSITORS (CASH RESERVE) (NO. 4) ORDER, 1991

In exercise of the power conferred upon the Minister by section 5 (1) (@) of the
bling, the follow-

ing Order is hereby made:—

1. This Order may be cited 2s the Protection of Depositors (Cash Reserve) Mo.

4) Order, 1991 and shall come into operation on the 1st day of July, 1991.

2. Bvery licensee carrying on a business of any class or description whatsoever,
in respect of which a licence has been granted, shall maintain in the form of a
deposit with the Bank of Jamaica 2 cash reserve mot less on the average than

eight per centum (89%) of the amount of its deposit liabilities.

3. The Protection of Depositoré (Cash Reserve) (No. 3) Order, 1991 is hereby
revoked. . '

- Dated at Kingston this 26th day of June, 1991.

. P. J. PATTERSON,

-‘Minister of Finance, Development
' and Planning.

No. 429/056 .




JAMAICA GAZETTE
 SUPPLEMENT

PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIOlNS“

- 127

Vol. CXV - MONDAY, JULY 6, 1992 = . Noe.24

—
———

No.44 . | , ST .

- 'THE MINIMUM WAGE ACT

Tue NATIONAL MINIMUM WAGE (AMENDMENT) ORDER, 1992
) In.-exercisc"of ‘the power conferred upon the Minister by section 3 of
the Minimum Wage Act, and of every other power hereunto enabling,
the following Order is-hereby made: . - ' :

. 1. This Order may be cited as the National Minimum Wage
(Amendment) Order, 1992, and shall be read and construed as one

with the National Minimum Wage Order, 1975 (hereinafter referred

to as the principal Order) and all amendments thereto.




128 PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS ~ [JuLy 6, 1952

" 2. The principal Order is amended by deleting paragraphs 4 and 5
and substituting therefor the following— '

' “Néﬁmuai 4. Subject to the provisions of paragraph 8, with effect from
wage. | the sixth day of July, 1992, the national minimum wage fot
workers, other than hou_sehold workers, is hereby fixed at

the rate of— =

(a) $7.50 pé;j hour for work done by such workers

during any period not exceeding—
O. : (@) 8 hours on a normal working day; or
L » ‘ ' (ii) 40 hours in any week; ,
g ’ : o (b) $11.25 per hour for work done by such workers
' ‘ during any period in excess of 8 hours on a normal
working day or in excess of 40 hours in any week;
(c) $15.00 per hour for work done by such workers

- during any period on a rest day or on a public
holiday. '

ooyt 5.—(1) Subject to. the provisions of paragraph &, with

wagofors -effect from the sixth day of July, 1992 the minimum wage

workers.  for household workers who are employed as weekly workers
is hereby fixed at the rate of—

(a) $300.00 per week for work done by household

workers whose normal working week is 40 hours,
and $11.25 per hour for work done during any
period in excess of 40 hours in any week; ‘
() $307.50 per week for work done by household
workers whose normal working week is 41 hours,
and ' o
$11.25 per hour for work done during any period
in excess of 41 hours in any week: -
() $315.00 per week for work done by household
workers whose normal working week is 42 hours
il © $11.25 per hour for work done during any period
L in excess of 42 hours in any week; o
(d) $322.50 per week for work done by household
" workers whose normal working week is 43 hours,
and ' T :
$11.25 per hour for work done in excess of 43 hours
in any week; o :

.




. Jury 6, 1992] PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS 129

(e) $330.00 per week for work done by.household
workers whose normal working week is 44 hours
and '

$11.25 per hour for work done during any period

in excess of 44 hours in any week;

o - (f) $15.00 per hour for work done by household
_ Q C . workers during any period on a rest day or public
‘ | ~ holiday. :

. (2) Subject to the provisions of paragraph 8, with effect
from the sixth day of July, 1992, the minimum wage for
household workers who are employed as hourly workers -
is hereby fixed at the rate of—

(a) $7.50 per hour for work done by such household |
workers during any period not exceeding 8 hours
_ . : on any day other than a public holiday;
v - (b) $11.25 per hour for work done by such household
: o - workers during any period in excess of 8§ hours on
. any day other than a public holiday;
(c) $15.00 per hour for work done by those workers
during any period on a public holiday.

~ (3) In this paragraph— :
“hourly workers” means workers who usually work for
less than 40 hours per week for any one employer:

“normal working week” means the number of hours in
each week during which a weekly worker in rela-
tion to whom that expression is used is normally
required to work for his employer, but does not
include any period an a rest day or a public holiday;

“weekly workers” means workers. th, by agreement
with their employers, regularly work for not less
than 40 hours per week for any one employer.”.

3. Pararaph 8 of the principal Order is amended by inserting after
sub-paragraph (2) the following as sub-paragraph 33—
« (3) For the avoidance of doubt, no worker shall be paid less
than the rates of wages fixed by this Order.”.

Dated this 29th.day of June, 1992.

L oN

~ PORTIA SIMPSON, S
- No. 193 /82 Minister of Labour, Welfare and Sports.

PRINTED BY THE GOVERNMENT PRINTER, DUKE STREET, XINGSTON, JAMAICA,




- ] Bibliothéque du BIT, CH-1211 Genéve 22

P60387 : 28 FEB 2002

JAMAICA GAZETTE SUPPLEM_ENT:
PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REG

c. 1

. GAZERTE

O |
wy : . : ‘
S - - SUPPLEMENT
- PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS
4 539
Vol. CXXIV MONDAY, DECEMBER 10, 2001 No. 111
No. 187
i ;‘ NI . THE MINIMUM WAGE ACT |
(Q ) THE MINIMUM WAGE (INDUSTRIAL SECURITY GUARDS) .(AMENDMENT) ORDER, 2001

In exercise of the power conferred upon the Minister by section 3 of the Minimum
Wage Act, the following Order is hereby made:— * *

: : . 1. This Order may be cited as the Minimum Wage (Industrial Security Guards)
(Amendment) Order, 2001, and shall be read and construed as one with the
Minimum Wage, (Industrial Security Guards) Order, 1982 (hereinafter referred
to as the principal Order) and all amendments thereto, and shall come into opera-
tion on the 7th day of January, 2002. : S




0y

540 PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS [Dkc. 10, 2001

2. Paragraph 4 of the principal Order is amended—

(a) by deleting from sub-paragraph (a) thevﬁgures “$50.50” and substituting
therefor the figures “$70.70”;

(b) by deleting from sub-paragraph (b) the figures “$75.75” and subst1tut1ng

- —therefor-the figures “$106.05”; -

(¢) by deleting from sub-paragraph (c) the figures “$101.00” and substltutmg _

. therefor the figures “§141 40”

ISP

3 Paragraph 6 of the pr1n01pa1 Order is amended—

(a) in sub-paragraph (1)(@) by deleting the figures “$10. 00” and substltutmg
--therefor-the figures “$15.00”; A

(b) in sub-paragraph (1)b) by deleting the figures “$10.00” and subsntutm
-—therefor-the-figures “$15.00”; -

(c) in sub-paragraph (1)(c) by deleting the ﬁgures “$5 OO” and substltutmg
.therefor. the figures “$10.00”.

-4 Sub-paragraph (a) of paragraph 8 of the pr1n01pal Order is amended’ by

deleting the words “eight-hundred thousand dollars” and substitutinig: ‘therefor
the words “one million dollars”.

Dated this 10th day of December, 2001.

) DoNALD BUCHANAN,
Minister of Labour and Social Security.

No. CA193/S3

PR X

FRINTED BY JAMAICA PRINTING SERVICES (1992) LTD., {GOVERNMENT PRINTERS), DUKE ST., KGN., JAMAICA.




; Bibliothéque du BIT, CH-1211 Genéve 22

P&0387 . 28 FEB 2002
JAMATICA GAZETTE SUPPLEMENT:
PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REG

c. 1

#¢
I

THE

~ JAMAICA GAZETTE

SUPPLEMENT

PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS

%
' 541
Vol. CXXIV_______ MONDAY, DECEMBER 10, 2001 ... ___ No.112

- No.*188~

" THE MINIMUM WAGE ACT
~ THE NATIONAL MINIMUM WAGE (AMENDMENT) ORDER, 2001

In exercise-of -the-power ‘conferred upoﬁ the Minister by section 3 of- the-Minimum -

. Wage Act, and of every other power hereunto enabling, the following Order is hereby -

made :—

1. This Order may be cited as the National Minimum Wage (Amendment)
- Order, 2001, and shall be read and construed as one with the National Minimum' > *
Wage Order, 1975 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Order) and all amend-

ments thereto.




542 PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS [Dkc. 10, 2001

2. Paragraph 4 of the principal Order is amended—

(a) by deleting the words “2nd day of August, 1999” and substituting there-
for the words “7th day of January, 2002”;

(b) in sub-paragraph (a) by deleting the figures “$30. 00” and substituting
therefor the ﬁgures “g45. 007;

(c) in sub-paragraph (b) by deleting: the ﬁgures “$45 00” and substltutmg
"+ therefor the figures “$67.50”;

@) in sub-paragraph_(c) by deleting the figures “$60 OO” and substituting

e

therefor the figures “$90. 00”’;

3. Paragraph 5 of the principal Order is amended—.... & - - :

(@) in sub-paragraph (1) by deleting the words “2nd day of August 1999”7

and substituting therefor the words “7th day of J anuary, 2002”;

S ' (b) in sub-paragraph (1Xa) by deleting the figures “$1,200.00” and “$45 00”

and substituting therefor the figures “$1,800” and “$67.50”, respectively;

. (¢) in sub-paragraph (1)(15) by deleting the figures “$1,230.00” and “$45.00”

O ] ' - and substituting therefor the figures “$1,845” and “$67.50", respectively;
(D in sub-paragraph (1)(c) by deleting the figures “$1,260.00” -and *“$45.00”

and substituting therefor the figures “$1,890” and “$67.50” respectively;

o | 4 (e) in sub-paragraph (1)(d) by deleting the figures “$1,290.00” and *“$45.00”
| and substituting therefor the figures “$1,935.00” and “$67 50, respec-
: tively;

| ' - (f) - in sub-paragraph (1)(e) by deleting the figures “$1,320.00”” and “$45.00”
and subs’ututmg therefor the figures “$1,980” and “$67.50”, respectively;

! ' (g) in sub-paragraph (1)) by deleting the ﬁgures “$60 OO” and subsfatutmg

therefor the figures “$90.007;

(h) in sub- paragraph (2) by deleting the words “2nd day of August 1999
and substituting therefor the words “7th day of January, 2002”;

K : (i) in sub-paragraph (2)(a) by deletmg the ﬁgures “$30.00” and substltutmg
o e _therefor-the-figures—*$45.007%— —~—

() in sub-paragraph (2)(b) by deletmg the ﬁgures “$45 00” and substltutmg
+ . therefor the figures. “$67.50”; - ; e

N ' | - .- (k) in sub-paragraph (2)(c) by deletmg the ﬁgures “$60 00”. émd substltutmg
O . , _ ‘therefor the figures “$90.00”.

Dated this 26th day of qucmbe_r,- 2001.

DONALD BUCHANAN,
Minister of Labour and Social Security.

‘No. CA193/82 ,

! . . PRINTED BY JAMAICA PRINTING SERVIGES (1992) LTD., (GOVERNMENT PRINTERS), DUKE ST., KGN., JAMAICA,




e

= : Jam —2005 ~R 7OV

JAMAICA GAZETTE
SUPPLEMENT

PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS

| Vol. CXXVI]I THURSDAY, JANUARY 13, 2005 No.1

No. | ' ;
THE MINIMUM WAGE ACT

THE NATIONAL MINIMUM WAGE (AMENDMENT) ORDER, 2005

In exercise of the power conferred upon the Minister by section 3 of the Minimum Wage Act,
and of every other power hereunto enabling, the following Order is hereby made:—

1. This Order may be cited as the National Minimum Wage (Amendment) Order, 2005,
and shall be read and construed as one with the National Minimum Wage Order, 1975
(hereinafter referred to as the principal Order) and all amendments thereto and shall come
into operation on the 31st day January, 2005.

2. Paragraph 4 of the principal Order is amended—

(a) by deleting the words “1st day of November, 2003” and substituting therefor the
words “31st day of January, 2005";

(b) in sub-paragraph (a) by deleting the numeral “$50.00” and substituting therefor
the numeral “$60.00”;




D

2 PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS [JAN. 13,2005

(¢) in sub-paragraph (b) by deleting the numeral “$75.00” and substituting therefor
the numeral “$90.00’; and

(d) in sub-paragraph (c) by deleting the numeral “$100.00” and substituting therefor
-the numeral “$120.00”.

3. Paragraph 5 of the principal Order is amended—

(a) in sub-paragraph (1) by deleting the words “Ist day of November, 2003" and
substituting therefor the words “31stday of January, 2005";

(b) in sub-paragraph (1)(a) by deleting the numerals “$2,000.00” and “$75.00” and
substituting therefor the numerals “$2,400.00” and “$90.00”, respectively;

(c) in sub-paragraph (1)(b) by deleting the numerals “$2,050.00” and “$75.00” and
substituting therefor the numerals “$2,460.00” and “$90.00”, respectively;

(d) in sub-paragraph (1)(c) by deleting the numerals “$2,100.00” and “$75.00” and
substituting therefor the numerals “$2,520.00” and “$90.00”, respectively;

(¢) in sub-paragraph (1)(d) by deleting the numerals “$2,150.00” and “$75.00” and
substituting therefor the numerals “$2,580.00” and “$90.00”, respectively;

(f) in sub-paragraph (1)(e) by deleting the numerals “$2,200.00” and “$75.00” and
substituting therefor the numerals “$2,640.00” and “$90.00”, respectively;

(g) insub-paragraph (1)(f) by deleting the numeral “$100.00” and substituting therefor
the numeral “$120.00”;

(h) in sub-paragraph (2) by deleting the words “Ist day of November, 2003" and
substituting therefor the words “31st day of January, 2005";

(i) insub-paragraph (2)(a) by deleting the numeral “$50.00” and substituting therefor
the numeral “$60.00”;

() insub-paragraph(2)(b) by deleting the numeral “$75.00” and substituting therefor
the numeral “$90.00”’; and

(k) insub-paragraph (2)(c) by deleting the numeral “$100.00” and substituting therefor
the numeral “$120.00”. :

Dated this 11th day of January, 2005.

HORACE DALLEY
Minister of Labour and Social Security.

No. CA193/S2




.

JAN. 13,2005] PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS 3

No. 2

THE MINIMUM WAGE (INDUSTRIAL SECURITY GUARDS) (AMENDMENT) ORDER, 2005

In exercise of the power conferred upon the Minister by section 3 of the Minimum Wage Act,
and of every other power hereunto enabling, the following Order is hereby made:—

1. This Order may be cited as the Minimum Wage (Industrial Security Guards)
(Amendment) Order, 2005, and shall be read and construed as one with the Minimum Wage
(Industrial Security Guards) Order, 1982 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Order) and all
amendments thereto and shall come into operation on the 31st day of January, 2005.

2. Paragraph 4 of the principal Order is amended—

(a) by deleting the words “1st day of November, 2003” and substituting therefor the
words “31st day of January, 2005”;

(b) by deleting from sub-paragraph (a) the numeral “$80.00” and substituting therefor
the numeral “$90.00”;

(c) by deleting from sub-paragraph (b) the numeral “$120.00” and substituting therefor
the numeral “3$135.00”; and

(d) by deleting from sub-paragraph (c) the numeral “$160.00” and substituting therefor
the numeral “$180.00”.

3. Paragraph 6 of the principal Order is amended—

(a) by deleting the words “1st day of November, 2003” and substituting therefor the
words “31st day of January, 2005";

(b) insub-paragraph (1)(a) by deleting the numeral “$16.50” and substituting therefor
the numeral “$18.00”;

(c) insub-paragraph (1)(b) by deleting the numeral “$17.00” and substituting therefor
the numeral “$20.00”; and

(d) insub-paragraph (1)(c) by deleting the numeral “$12.00” and substltutmg therefor
the numeral “$14.00”.

Dated this 11th day of January, 2005.

HORACE DALLEY
Minister of Labour and Social Security.

No. CA193/S2




